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More Than a Parade is a behind-the-scenes look at Pasadena's famed Tournament of Roses, told by longtime
Tournament Volunteer and 2004 president Michael K. Riffey. Riffey shares stories of the hard work, drama
and fun that go in to making the Pasadena Tournament of Roses one of the "gotta see" events on the nation's
TV schedule. Preparation for next year's parade begins soon after the last street sweeper finishes cleaning up.
Months of travel, auditions, design decisions, and logistical setbacks all come together for one day of
glorious pageantry. Riffey introduces you to float designers and builders, parade queens, equestrian units,
band members, and an army of sometimes contentious volunteers. He also answers some of the most
frequently asked questions about the parade-and the Rose Bowl football game.
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From reader reviews:

Amy Dixon:

Inside other case, little men and women like to read book More Than A Parade: The Spirit and Passion
Behind The Pasadena Tournament of Roses. You can choose the best book if you'd prefer reading a book.
Providing we know about how is important the book More Than A Parade: The Spirit and Passion Behind
The Pasadena Tournament of Roses. You can add knowledge and of course you can around the world by just
a book. Absolutely right, due to the fact from book you can realize everything! From your country until
eventually foreign or abroad you may be known. About simple issue until wonderful thing you can know
that. In this era, we are able to open a book as well as searching by internet product. It is called e-book. You
should use it when you feel weary to go to the library. Let's examine.

Donald Jones:

Playing with family in a park, coming to see the sea world or hanging out with pals is thing that usually you
will have done when you have spare time, subsequently why you don't try factor that really opposite from
that. Just one activity that make you not sense tired but still relaxing, trilling like on roller coaster you are
ride on and with addition info. Even you love More Than A Parade: The Spirit and Passion Behind The
Pasadena Tournament of Roses, you are able to enjoy both. It is excellent combination right, you still desire
to miss it? What kind of hangout type is it? Oh can happen its mind hangout men. What? Still don't get it, oh
come on its referred to as reading friends.

Charlotte Bernstein:

Are you kind of hectic person, only have 10 or maybe 15 minute in your moment to upgrading your mind
skill or thinking skill perhaps analytical thinking? Then you are having problem with the book than can
satisfy your small amount of time to read it because all this time you only find book that need more time to
be learn. More Than A Parade: The Spirit and Passion Behind The Pasadena Tournament of Roses can be
your answer since it can be read by an individual who have those short spare time problems.

Christina Harper:

Beside this particular More Than A Parade: The Spirit and Passion Behind The Pasadena Tournament of
Roses in your phone, it might give you a way to get more close to the new knowledge or data. The
information and the knowledge you may got here is fresh from your oven so don't possibly be worry if you
feel like an old people live in narrow commune. It is good thing to have More Than A Parade: The Spirit and
Passion Behind The Pasadena Tournament of Roses because this book offers for you readable information.
Do you oftentimes have book but you rarely get what it's interesting features of. Oh come on, that would not
happen if you have this with your hand. The Enjoyable agreement here cannot be questionable, including
treasuring beautiful island. Use you still want to miss the item? Find this book as well as read it from right
now!
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