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Players and fans of tennis will find this facsimile of the game’s original rules a fascinating historical
document. Until the 1870s, tennis was an indoor sport reserved for the rich. That changed in 1873, when
Walter Wingfield published for the first time the rules of Sphairistike, the Greek name he used for lawn
tennis. Republished from one of the only surviving copies of the second edition, released the following year,
Wingfield’s rules make for an engrossing artifact of tennis’s beginning as a truly popular sport. The book
includes press accounts from the period describing and commenting upon the pastime, a price list for
equipment, and a list of prominent Victorians who were giving the new sport a try.
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From reader reviews:

Joan Rogers:

Have you spare time for the day? What do you do when you have a lot more or little spare time? Yes, you
can choose the suitable activity with regard to spend your time. Any person spent all their spare time to take
a go walking, shopping, or went to the particular Mall. How about open or perhaps read a book eligible The
Game of Sphairistike or Lawn Tennis: A Facsimile of the Original (1874) Rules of Tennis? Maybe it is to be
best activity for you. You understand beside you can spend your time with the favorite's book, you can better
than before. Do you agree with its opinion or you have additional opinion?

Lori McDonald:

In this 21st centuries, people become competitive in each and every way. By being competitive now, people
have do something to make them survives, being in the middle of the actual crowded place and notice by
simply surrounding. One thing that often many people have underestimated this for a while is reading. Yeah,
by reading a publication your ability to survive improve then having chance to stay than other is high. For
yourself who want to start reading a new book, we give you this particular The Game of Sphairistike or
Lawn Tennis: A Facsimile of the Original (1874) Rules of Tennis book as nice and daily reading e-book.
Why, because this book is greater than just a book.

Edward McClung:

Reading a publication can be one of a lot of activity that everyone in the world really likes. Do you like
reading book consequently. There are a lot of reasons why people fantastic. First reading a publication will
give you a lot of new facts. When you read a book you will get new information due to the fact book is one
of various ways to share the information as well as their idea. Second, reading through a book will make a
person more imaginative. When you reading through a book especially hype book the author will bring that
you imagine the story how the figures do it anything. Third, you can share your knowledge to other
individuals. When you read this The Game of Sphairistike or Lawn Tennis: A Facsimile of the Original
(1874) Rules of Tennis, you are able to tells your family, friends and soon about yours guide. Your
knowledge can inspire different ones, make them reading a e-book.

Joyce Francois:

In this time globalization it is important to someone to acquire information. The information will make a
professional understand the condition of the world. The fitness of the world makes the information quicker to
share. You can find a lot of recommendations to get information example: internet, newspaper, book, and
soon. You can see that now, a lot of publisher that will print many kinds of book. The particular book that
recommended to your account is The Game of Sphairistike or Lawn Tennis: A Facsimile of the Original
(1874) Rules of Tennis this reserve consist a lot of the information of the condition of this world now. This
particular book was represented how do the world has grown up. The terminology styles that writer make



usage of to explain it is easy to understand. Often the writer made some research when he makes this book.
This is why this book acceptable all of you.
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