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Backed by the resources of Independent Feature Project/West, co-authors Nicole Shay LaLoggia and Eden
H. Wurmfeld have written the definitive low-budget production manual. Using examples from the Miramax
film Swingers, this comprehensive manual offers the independent filmmaker a single volume reference
covering every aspect of making a film: script rights and rewrites, financing, breakdown, scheduling and
budgeting, pre-production, production, postproduction, and distribution. A resource guide listing useful
references and organizations, as well as a glossary, complete this manual. The companion CD-ROM features
interviews with important figures in the independent film industry, including Billy Bob Thornton and Ang
Lee. Forms that are illuminated in the text are also included on the CD for ease of use.

Independent Feature Project/West is non-profit membership organization for independent filmmakers.
IFP/West provides its members with access to industry leaders, professional advice, discounts, and rental
equipment. IFP/West also provides a comprehensive educational program covering all aspects of the
filmmaking process from script to post-production, to marketing and distribution. Since its inception,
IFP/West has become the primary support network for filmmakers in Southern California and is a strong
advocate for diversity and innovation in filmmaking.
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From reader reviews:

Eleanor Sotomayor:

The ability that you get from IFP/West Independent Filmmaker's Manual could be the more deep you
digging the information that hide inside words the more you get considering reading it. It does not mean that
this book is hard to comprehend but IFP/West Independent Filmmaker's Manual giving you joy feeling of
reading. The writer conveys their point in a number of way that can be understood by anyone who read the
item because the author of this reserve is well-known enough. This book also makes your current vocabulary
increase well. That makes it easy to understand then can go together with you, both in printed or e-book style
are available. We recommend you for having this kind of IFP/West Independent Filmmaker's Manual
instantly.

Walter Taylor:

This book untitled IFP/West Independent Filmmaker's Manual to be one of several books this best seller in
this year, this is because when you read this reserve you can get a lot of benefit in it. You will easily to buy
this kind of book in the book retail store or you can order it by means of online. The publisher with this book
sells the e-book too. It makes you quicker to read this book, as you can read this book in your Smart phone.
So there is no reason for you to past this e-book from your list.

Travis Smith:

Is it a person who having spare time then spend it whole day simply by watching television programs or just
laying on the bed? Do you need something new? This IFP/West Independent Filmmaker's Manual can be the
response, oh how comes? The new book you know. You are consequently out of date, spending your time by
reading in this new era is common not a geek activity. So what these ebooks have than the others?

Ruth Zimmer:

A lot of guide has printed but it is unique. You can get it by web on social media. You can choose the best
book for you, science, amusing, novel, or whatever simply by searching from it. It is named of book
IFP/West Independent Filmmaker's Manual. You'll be able to your knowledge by it. Without leaving the
printed book, it can add your knowledge and make an individual happier to read. It is most critical that, you
must aware about publication. It can bring you from one place to other place.
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