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Double sided map of the Peninsular Malaysia at 1:1,500,000 and a street plan of Singapore at 1:15,000, with
a smaller sheet size offering a convenient format for use when travelling.

On one side is a road map of the western, peninsular part of Malaysia. Vivid relief shading, numerous spot
and names of mountain ranges, plus graphics for marshlands present the topography. National parks and
other protected area are marked. Road network distinguishes between highways in good and poor condition
and includes partially paved roads and cart tracks, with distances shown on main routes. Railway lines and
local airports are included, and the map also shows internal administrative boundaries with names of the
states. Numerous places of interest are prominently marked. Latitude and longitude margin ticks are at 1°
intervals. The map has no index of localities. Map legend includes English.

The map is accompanied by enlargements showing in greater detail the Kuala Lumpur region at 1:500,000,
Penang at 1:300,000 and Pangkor at 1:135,000, plus street plans highlighting main places of interest in
central Kuala Lumpur at 1:20,000, George Town (Penang) at 1:23,000 and Melaka (Malacca) at 1:11,500.

On the reverse, central Singapore is shown on a street plan at 1:15,000, clearly indicating metro stations and
showing public buildings and various places of interest. The plan is indexed for streets, housing and
industrial estates, places of interest, hotels, embassies and medical centres. 64 institutions marked on the plan
within the Business District are also listed.

Also included is a map of the whole Singapore Island at 1:125,000 clearly showing railway connections, plus
an enlargement of the Sentosa Island at 1:22,500.
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From reader reviews:

Margaret Williams:

Why don't make it to become your habit? Right now, try to prepare your time to do the important take action,
like looking for your favorite book and reading a book. Beside you can solve your problem; you can add
your knowledge by the reserve entitled Malaysia West 1:1,500,000 & Singapore 1:15,000 Travel Map with
city plans NELLES. Try to make book Malaysia West 1:1,500,000 & Singapore 1:15,000 Travel Map with
city plans NELLES as your good friend. It means that it can to become your friend when you really feel
alone and beside regarding course make you smarter than before. Yeah, it is very fortuned for you. The book
makes you a lot more confidence because you can know every little thing by the book. So , we need to make
new experience and knowledge with this book.

Kina Chatman:

Have you spare time to get a day? What do you do when you have much more or little spare time? Yeah, you
can choose the suitable activity intended for spend your time. Any person spent their own spare time to take
a move, shopping, or went to often the Mall. How about open or read a book allowed Malaysia West
1:1,500,000 & Singapore 1:15,000 Travel Map with city plans NELLES? Maybe it is to be best activity for
you. You already know beside you can spend your time with your favorite's book, you can wiser than before.
Do you agree with their opinion or you have various other opinion?

Tony Valdez:

The book Malaysia West 1:1,500,000 & Singapore 1:15,000 Travel Map with city plans NELLES can give
more knowledge and also the precise product information about everything you want. Exactly why must we
leave a good thing like a book Malaysia West 1:1,500,000 & Singapore 1:15,000 Travel Map with city plans
NELLES? A few of you have a different opinion about reserve. But one aim that book can give many
information for us. It is absolutely suitable. Right now, try to closer using your book. Knowledge or data that
you take for that, you are able to give for each other; you may share all of these. Book Malaysia West
1:1,500,000 & Singapore 1:15,000 Travel Map with city plans NELLES has simple shape nevertheless, you
know: it has great and big function for you. You can look the enormous world by open and read a reserve. So
it is very wonderful.

Barbara Hall:

You can spend your free time to study this book this e-book. This Malaysia West 1:1,500,000 & Singapore
1:15,000 Travel Map with city plans NELLES is simple to create you can read it in the playground, in the
beach, train and soon. If you did not possess much space to bring the printed book, you can buy the e-book.
It is make you better to read it. You can save often the book in your smart phone. And so there are a lot of
benefits that you will get when one buys this book.
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