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The harrowing first-person account of a French foot soldier who survived four years in the trenches of
the First World War

Along with millions of other Frenchmen, Louis Barthas, a thirty-five-year-old barrelmaker from a small
wine-growing town, was conscripted to fight the Germans in the opening days of World War I. Corporal
Barthas spent the next four years in near-ceaseless combat, wherever the French army fought its fiercest
battles: Artois, Flanders, Champagne, Verdun, the Somme, the Argonne. Barthas’ riveting wartime narrative,
first published in France in 1978, presents the vivid, immediate experiences of a frontline soldier.
 
This excellent new translation brings Barthas’ wartime writings to English-language readers for the first
time. His notebooks and letters represent the quintessential memoir of a “poilu,” or “hairy one,” as the
untidy, unshaven French infantryman of the fighting trenches was familiarly known. Upon Barthas’ return
home in 1919, he painstakingly transcribed his day-to-day writings into nineteen notebooks, preserving not
only his own story but also the larger story of the unnumbered soldiers who never returned. Recounting
bloody battles and endless exhaustion, the deaths of comrades, the infuriating incompetence and tyranny of
his own officers, Barthas also describes spontaneous acts of camaraderie between French poilus and their
German foes in trenches just a few paces apart. An eloquent witness and keen observer, Barthas takes his
readers directly into the heart of the Great War.
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From reader reviews:

William Nix:

As people who live in typically the modest era should be revise about what going on or information even
knowledge to make them keep up with the era which is always change and move ahead. Some of you maybe
will certainly update themselves by reading books. It is a good choice in your case but the problems coming
to a person is you don't know what one you should start with. This Poilu: The World War I Notebooks of
Corporal Louis Barthas, Barrelmaker, 1914-1918 is our recommendation to make you keep up with the
world. Why, as this book serves what you want and want in this era.

Concepcion Maldonado:

A lot of people always spent all their free time to vacation or even go to the outside with them loved ones or
their friend. Were you aware? Many a lot of people spent many people free time just watching TV, or maybe
playing video games all day long. If you wish to try to find a new activity this is look different you can read
a book. It is really fun for yourself. If you enjoy the book that you read you can spent all day long to reading
a e-book. The book Poilu: The World War I Notebooks of Corporal Louis Barthas, Barrelmaker, 1914-1918
it is extremely good to read. There are a lot of people that recommended this book. These folks were
enjoying reading this book. In case you did not have enough space to develop this book you can buy
typically the e-book. You can m0ore easily to read this book from your smart phone. The price is not to fund
but this book features high quality.

Deanna Jackson:

The book untitled Poilu: The World War I Notebooks of Corporal Louis Barthas, Barrelmaker, 1914-1918
contain a lot of information on that. The writer explains the woman idea with easy technique. The language
is very straightforward all the people, so do not worry, you can easy to read that. The book was written by
famous author. The author will bring you in the new era of literary works. It is easy to read this book because
you can read on your smart phone, or product, so you can read the book in anywhere and anytime. If you
want to buy the e-book, you can available their official web-site in addition to order it. Have a nice learn.

John Montes:

In this era globalization it is important to someone to get information. The information will make
professionals understand the condition of the world. The health of the world makes the information better to
share. You can find a lot of recommendations to get information example: internet, classifieds, book, and
soon. You can observe that now, a lot of publisher that will print many kinds of book. The actual book that
recommended to you is Poilu: The World War I Notebooks of Corporal Louis Barthas, Barrelmaker, 1914-
1918 this e-book consist a lot of the information from the condition of this world now. That book was
represented just how can the world has grown up. The words styles that writer require to explain it is easy to
understand. The particular writer made some research when he makes this book. This is why this book



appropriate all of you.
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