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Lady Victoria Mansfield, youngest daughter of the earl and countess of Fairmount, is destined for a charmed
life. Soon she will be presented during the London season, where she can choose a mate worthy of her status.

Yet Tory has a shameful secret?a secret so powerful that, if exposed, it could strip her of her position and
disgrace her family forever. Tory's blood is tainted . . . by magic.

When a shocking accident forces Tory to demonstrate her despised skill, the secret she's fought so hard to
hide is revealed for all to see. She is immediately exiled to Lackland Abbey, a reform school for young men
and women in her position. There she will learn to suppress her deplorable talents and maybe, if she's one of
the lucky ones, be able to return to society.

But Tory's life is about to change forever. All that she's ever known or considered important will be
challenged. What lies ahead is only the beginning of a strange and wonderful journey into a world where
destiny and magic come together, where true love and friendship find her, and where courage and strength of
character are the only things that determine a young girl's worth.

Dark Mirror is M.J. Putney's first young adult novel, and it's enthralling?an historical fantasy that's both
fast-paced and deeply moving.
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From reader reviews:

Paul Hinojosa:

Why don't make it to be your habit? Right now, try to ready your time to do the important take action, like
looking for your favorite e-book and reading a guide. Beside you can solve your problem; you can add your
knowledge by the book entitled Dark Mirror. Try to make the book Dark Mirror as your good friend. It
means that it can being your friend when you really feel alone and beside associated with course make you
smarter than ever before. Yeah, it is very fortuned for you personally. The book makes you more confidence
because you can know everything by the book. So , we need to make new experience as well as knowledge
with this book.

Nancy Smith:

What do you think about book? It is just for students since they are still students or the idea for all people in
the world, what best subject for that? Merely you can be answered for that question above. Every person has
distinct personality and hobby per other. Don't to be obligated someone or something that they don't desire
do that. You must know how great as well as important the book Dark Mirror. All type of book can you see
on many options. You can look for the internet solutions or other social media.

Betsy Haley:

Now a day people that Living in the era just where everything reachable by talk with the internet and the
resources in it can be true or not require people to be aware of each facts they get. How many people to be
smart in getting any information nowadays? Of course the answer is reading a book. Examining a book can
help folks out of this uncertainty Information mainly this Dark Mirror book because this book offers you rich
facts and knowledge. Of course the info in this book hundred per cent guarantees there is no doubt in it you
probably know this.

Edward Reed:

Many people spending their time by playing outside along with friends, fun activity together with family or
just watching TV all day every day. You can have new activity to pay your whole day by studying a book.
Ugh, do you think reading a book can actually hard because you have to bring the book everywhere? It all
right you can have the e-book, getting everywhere you want in your Touch screen phone. Like Dark Mirror
which is getting the e-book version. So , try out this book? Let's notice.
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